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S. 
No.

Form No Full Name Score
Score awarded by 

Screening Committee/ 
Remarks

Representation 
received

Eligibility Status after 
scrutiny of received 

representation

1 37COM02OBC38
AMRENDRA 
KUMAR

148.6 Eligible
Request for 
reconsideration in 
API Score.

Eligible
No change in Score.

4 37COM02OBC683
Nand Kishor 
Mandal

0
Not Eligible
Print Copy of application 
not received.

Request for 
reconsideration

Not Eligible
Print copy of application 
not received by last date of 
submission.

7 37COM02OBC1149 DR. VINEET SINGH 1355.3

Provisionally Eligible
Subject to submission of 
certificate that Ph.D. 
pursued without taking any 
kind of leave.

Submitted Requisite 
document.

Eligible

8 37COM02OBC1186
DR. BUDHESHWAR 
PRASAD 
SINGHRAUL

515

Provisionally Eligible
Subject to submission of 
certificate that Ph.D. 
pursued without taking any 
kind of leave. 

Submitted Requisite 
document.

Eligible

9 37COM02OBC1280
VINOD KUMAR 
YADAV

0

Not Eligible
Not having 8 years’ 
experience in accordance 
with clause 10 of UGC 
Regulation 2018.

Experience 
Certificate 

Not Eligible
Teaching experience was 
not claimed in the original 
form for the position.

304.8

Provisionally Eligible
Subject to submission of 
offer letter of previous 
employers and experience 
certificate from present 
employer. 

Offer letters and 
Appointment orders 
of previous 
employers and Pay 
Slips (Nov,21 & 
Aug,22) of present 
empolyer. 

Eligible

- Not Eligible

6 37COM02OBC970
DR. ANURAG 
BHADUR SINGH

0

Not Eligible
No Good Academic Record 
as candidate having less 
than 45% marks in UG.

1115

Provisionally Eligible
Subject to submission of 
experience certificate with 
pay details from present 
employer.

Appointment Order, 
Absorption letter 
and Pay Slip

Eligible

5 37COM02OBC773 V Richard Paul

Request for 
reconsideration

Not Eligible
Not having 8 years’ 
experience in accordance 
with clause 10 (f) (iii) of 
UGC Regulation 2018.

3 37COM02OBC621
DHANDAYUTHAPANI 
S P

0

Not Eligible
Not having 8 years’ 
experience in accordance 
with clause 10 of UGC 
Regulation 2018.
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